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Providing students with written feedback on their homework yields many benefits on their learning 
(Black, Harrison, Lee, Marshall & William, 2003; Fyfe, 2016; Landers & Reinholz, 2015). These 
benefits include providing students with information on their current levels of understanding, and in 
providing possible next steps for student improvement. However, in many cases, teachers take the 
position of “presenter of knowledge” (Black et al., 2003, p. 89), providing students with feedback 
that they assume the students need, and which may or may not match the actual students’ needs. 
Students, on the other hand, rarely read and implement change on their work based on the written 
feedback (Black et. al., 2003), making the feedback lose its effectiveness. To improve the 
effectiveness of written feedback, researchers suggest that teachers seek different ways of using 
written feedback in mathematics classrooms (Frey & Fisher, 2011). We conjectured that using 
cogenerative dialogues (cogens) (Emdin, 2016; Tobin, 2006) to invite students into deciding on the 
nature of written feedback they would be receiving, and ways of using it efficiently, may support 
more student-centered forms of feedback. 

We carried out a practitioner-inquiry study (Samaras & Freese, 2009) in a first year undergraduate 
Probability and Statistics class taught by Wambua. The class consisted of ten students at a private 
university in the Northeastern region of the United States. We hypothesized that we could improve 
the effectiveness of written feedback in classroom tasks by leveraging student autonomy to shape the 
nature of the feedback they received and in deciding how they use the feedback to produce new 
work. For six weeks, we held 15-minutes long cogens (structured teacher-student dialogues aimed at 
co-constructing classroom practices) after each class with all participants. For data analysis, we used 
constant comparison method (Savin-Baden, & Major, 2013). We coded all cogen-transcripts, 
students’ worksheets and teacher’s feedback to look for evidence of improvement in the teacher’s 
feedback based on students’ comments. 

Working closely with students through weekly cogens focused on improving written feedback as a 
formative assessment technique generated improvements in three areas: (a) helping the teacher 
transition from giving general feedback to give specific feedback, (b) providing students 
opportunities to state how immediate feedback supported their learning and (c) in transforming the 
classroom culture. By listening to and learning from the students, the teacher improved her written 
feedback from using general statements like “Good job” and “explain more” to providing more 
elaborate feedback that articulated what was right or wrong in the students’ work, and gave 
suggestions on how to correct the mistakes. The students highlighted that the cogens provided 
opportunities for prompt and focused feedback that helped them curtail practicing the same mistake 
in future. Finally, the cogens boosted students’ motivation in their mathematical abilities and served 
as an evidence that their perspectives and experiences are valuable in co-constructing classroom 
practices. In future, we hope to explore how cogens could leverage feedback provision in larger class 
sizes and in education levels beyond undergraduate.  
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